

Intent to Award Breakdown						
Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Totals	
Total Key Control						
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$18,685.00	\$18,685.00	
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$29,638.00	\$29,638.00	
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25		\$6.10	\$305.00	
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20		\$6.10	\$305.00	
					Total Key Control Total	\$48,933.00
Independent Hardware South						
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		\$3,905.50	\$7,811.00	
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$37.39	\$9,347.50	
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$54.78	\$13,695.00	
30	Security Cable	999263		\$19.38	\$581.40	
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$37.39	\$1,121.70	
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$54.78	\$1,643.40	
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	\$136.54	\$6,827.00	
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		\$54.78	\$2,739.00	
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		\$1,599.60	\$1,599.60	
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	\$54.78	\$65,736.00	
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	\$85.91	\$17,182.00	
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	\$40.67	\$24,402.00	
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	\$40.67	\$24,402.00	
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		\$6.67	\$166.75	
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		\$7.83	\$195.75	
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		\$7.87	\$19,675.00	
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		\$9.03	\$4,515.00	
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		\$11.74	\$293.50	
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		\$12.90	\$322.50	
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		\$4.99	\$124.75	
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		\$6.97	\$174.25	
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		\$4.95	\$1,237.50	
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		\$6.11	\$1,527.50	
3600	All Keys will be Serialized	50-229		\$1.81	\$6,516.00	
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles			\$14,400.00	\$14,400.00	
					Independent Hardware South Total	\$226,236.10
Total Bid Award						
						\$275,169.10

VENDOR: TOTAL KEY CONTROL

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Totals
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$18,685.00	\$18,685.00
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$29,638.00	\$29,638.00
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25		\$6.10	\$305.00
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20		\$6.10	\$305.00
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		No Bid	
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		No Bid	
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		No Bid	
30	Security Cable	999263		No Bid	
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		No Bid	
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		No Bid	
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	No Bid	
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		No Bid	
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		No Bid	
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	No Bid	
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	No Bid	
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	No Bid	
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	No Bid	
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		No Bid	
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		No Bid	
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		No Bid	
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		No Bid	
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		No Bid	
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		No Bid	
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		No Bid	
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		No Bid	
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		No Bid	
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		No Bid	
	All Keys will be Serialized			No Bid	
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles	50-229		No Bid	
	Totals			\$48,335.20	\$48,933.00

VENDOR: INDEPENDENT HARDWARE SOUTH

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Totals
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$22,732.38	\$22,732.38
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$34,239.04	\$34,239.04
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25		\$6.70	\$335.00
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20		\$6.70	\$335.00
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		\$3,905.50	\$7,811.00
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$37.39	\$9,347.50
30	FSIC for Padlocks Security Cable	23-030		\$54.78	\$13,695.00
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	999263		\$19.38	\$581.40
30	FSIC for Padlocks	KS43F3200		\$37.39	\$1,121.70
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	23-030	626	\$54.78	\$1,643.40
50	FSIC for Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626		\$136.54	\$6,827.00
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	23-030		\$54.78	\$2,739.00
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	SM01-391		\$1,599.60	\$1,599.60
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	23-030	626	\$54.78	\$65,736.00
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-740XP	626	\$85.91	\$17,182.00
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	20-079	626	\$40.67	\$24,402.00
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	30-016	626	\$40.67	\$24,402.00
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-269		\$6.67	\$166.75
2,500	Restricted Cut Keys	35-273XP		\$7.83	\$195.75
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-268		\$7.87	\$19,675.00
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	48-199XP		\$9.03	\$4,515.00
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-268		\$11.74	\$293.50
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	49-199XP		\$12.90	\$322.50
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-232		\$4.99	\$124.75
250	Restricted Key Blanks	50-214		\$6.97	\$174.25
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-268		\$4.95	\$1,237.50
3,600	All Keys will be Serialized	35-199-XP		\$6.11	\$1,527.50
1,200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles	50-229		\$1.81	\$6,516.00
Total					\$14,400.00
					\$283,877.52

VENDOR: AMERI-KEY LOCKSMITH, LLC

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Total
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key				
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key				
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25			
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20			
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010			
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200			
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030			
30	Security Cable	999263			
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200			
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030			
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626		
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030			
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391			
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626		
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626		
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626		
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626		
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269			
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP			
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268			
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP			
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268			
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP			
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232			
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214			
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268			
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP			
	All Keys will be Serialized	50-229			
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles			\$94,500.00	\$94,500.00
	Total			\$94,500.00	\$94,500.00

VENDOR: IDN - ARMSTRONG						
Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Totals	
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$21,984.89	\$21,984.89	
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$33,113.19	\$33,113.19	
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25	(10 Pack)	\$72.34	\$3,617.00	
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20	(10 Pack)	\$72.34	\$3,617.00	
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		\$4,787.23	\$9,574.46	
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	K543F3200		\$37.83	\$9,457.50	
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$54.77	\$13,692.50	
30	Security Cable	999263		\$20.12	\$603.60	
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	K543F3200		\$37.83	\$1,134.90	
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$54.77	\$1,643.10	
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	\$141.75	\$7,087.50	
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		\$54.77	\$2,738.50	
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		\$1,602.77	\$1,602.77	
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	\$54.77	\$65,724.00	
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	\$85.88	\$17,176.00	
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	\$40.66	\$24,396.00	
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	\$40.66	\$24,396.00	
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		\$6.68	\$167.00	
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		\$7.84	\$196.00	
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		\$7.88	\$19,700.00	
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		\$9.04	\$4,520.00	
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		\$11.77	\$294.25	
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		\$12.93	\$323.25	
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		\$5.00	\$125.00	
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		\$6.98	\$174.50	
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		\$4.96	\$1,240.00	
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		\$6.12	\$1,530.00	
3600	All Keys will be Serialized	50-229		\$1.81	\$6,516.00	
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles			NO BID	NO BID	
TOTAL					\$276,344.91	

VENDOR: SOUTHERN LOCK

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Totals
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$23,352.35	\$23,352.35
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$35,172.83	\$35,172.83
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25	(10 Pack)	\$70.52	\$352.60
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20	(10 Pack)	\$70.52	\$352.60
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		\$5,085.00	\$10,170.00
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$39.70	\$9,925.00
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$58.18	\$14,545.00
30	Security Cable	999263		\$21.37	\$641.10
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$39.70	\$1,191.00
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$58.18	\$1,745.40
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	\$150.57	\$7,528.50
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		\$58.18	\$2,909.00
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		\$2,101.80	\$2,101.80
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	\$58.18	\$69,816.00
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	\$91.25	\$18,250.00
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	\$43.19	\$25,914.00
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	\$43.19	\$25,914.00
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		\$9.01	\$225.25
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		\$10.25	\$256.25
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		\$10.30	\$25,750.00
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		\$11.53	\$5,765.00
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		\$14.41	\$360.25
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		\$15.65	\$391.25
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		\$5.30	\$132.50
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		\$7.42	\$185.50
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		\$7.18	\$1,795.00
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		\$8.42	\$2,105.00
	All Keys will be Serialized	50-229		Included in key cost	
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles				
	Total				\$286,847.18

VENDOR: A-1

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit	Total
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			\$40,651.60	\$40,651.60
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			\$61,322.80	\$61,322.80
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25	(25 Pack)	\$142.00	\$284.00
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20	(25 Pack)	\$142.00	\$284.00
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		\$13,000.00	\$13,000.00
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$19,850.00	\$19,850.00
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$29,050.00	\$29,050.00
30	Security Cable	999263		\$1,282.20	\$1,282.20
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		\$3,152.18	\$3,152.18
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		\$6,769.82	\$6,769.82
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	\$19,407.00	\$19,407.00
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		\$5,818.00	\$5,818.00
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		\$4,203.00	\$4,203.00
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	\$139,632.00	\$139,632.00
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	\$36,500.00	\$36,500.00
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	\$102,828.00	\$102,828.00
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	\$102,828.00	\$102,828.00
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		\$450.50	\$450.50
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		\$512.50	\$512.50
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		\$122,332.63	\$122,332.63
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		\$25,696.53	\$25,696.53
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		\$1,783.00	\$1,783.00
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		\$1,845.00	\$1,845.00
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		\$1,327.50	\$1,327.50
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		\$1,433.50	\$1,433.50
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		\$3,590.00	\$3,590.00
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		\$4,210.00	\$4,210.00
	All Keys will be Serialized				
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles			\$20,500.00	\$20,500.00
				\$59,500.00	\$59,500.00
				\$829,799.76	\$830,083.76

Price Per Unit
 Total

VENDOR: AFFORDABLE LOCK - REJECTED - INCOMPLETE BID SUBMITTAL

Quantity	Description	Part Number	Color	Price Per Unit
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 96 Key			
1	Morse Watchmans Key Watcher Touch System 192 Key			
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-20-25		
50	Morse Watchman Tamper Proof Key Ring	KR-15-20		
2	Triton Plus key cutting machine Ultimate Edition	20201010		
250	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		
250	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		
30	Security Cable	999263		
30	FSIC Core Padlocks 2 inch shackle by 3/8 inch dia	KS43F3200		
30	FSIC for Padlocks	23-030		
50	FSIC Series Door Handles	ALX53-J-TLR-626	626	
50	FSIC for Door Handles	23-030		
1	Schlage Sitemaster Key Management Software	SM01-391		
1,200	FSIC Core Restricted	23-030	626	
200	FSIC Core Primus XP	20-740XP	626	
600	FSIC Rim Housing Only	20-079	626	
600	FSIC Mortise Housing Only	30-016	626	
25	Restricted Control Key Blanks	35-269		
25	Primus XP Control Key Blanks	35-273XP		
2500	Restricted Cut Keys	48-268		
500	Primus XP Cut Keys	48-199XP		
25	Restricted Cut Master Keys	49-268		
25	Primus XP Cut Master Keys	49-199XP		
25	Extra Restricted Cut Key/Core	50-232		
25	Extra Primus XP Cut Key/Core	50-214		
250	Restricted Key Blanks	35-268		
250	Primus Xp Key Blanks	35-199-XP		
	All Keys will be Serialized	50-229		
1200	Labor to remove and install 1,400 cores/handles			\$78.75