BID TABUALTION SHEET — TEMPORARY EVENT STAFFING. RJS

package submitted and, once the evalnation of all bids
submitted is complets, the bid will be awarded to the
bidder who is most responsive 3and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes. Note: All hid forms are
not mandatory and if left cut of submittal the Authority
may ask for the form to be completed after the bid

Bid Due Date/Time: Friday July 9 202] @ ]Ogm
Pagel ol 4
Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the
lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive
BT SAs! comRe® 8 deiirod jevaletim of jesdh (i Rapid Staffing Staff Pro Workforce People Ready M&G Investors

General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment

opening date/time end submitted.
JOB CLASSIFICATION All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclustve Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate
Event Day Cleaning Specialist - $12.50 1.508 18.85 1.535 19.19 1.53 19.13 No Bid | NoBid

Post Clean Porter - $12.50 1.508 18.85 1.535 19.19 1.53 1903 5.38 17.88

Event Day/Post Clean Supervisor - $15.00 1.4834 22,25 1.37 20.55 1.53 | 2295 6.45 2145
Multiplier for other Job Classifications not listed | 1.508 1.37 No Bid 6.45 (51.433)

Guaerantee of Bid Proposal

Acknowledgment of Addendums, If Applicable

Acknowledgment of Bidder

NN S

Acknowledgment of Principal

Incomplete

Legal Status of Bidder

Bidder References

Sworn Statement — Public Entity Crimes

Sworn Statement — Relationship Disclosure(s)

Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment

E-Verify Affidavit
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Statement of No Bid

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

Bid Checklist (Not a Mandatory Form)




BID TABUALTION SHEET — TEMPORARY EVENT STAFFING, RJS

Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the
lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive
and responsible bid package. Tampa Sports Authority
staff must complete a detailed evaluation of each bid
packege submitted and, once the svaluation of all bids
submitted is complete, the bid will be awarded to the
bidder who is most responsive 3and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes, Note: All bid forms are
not mandatory and if left out of submittal the Authority
may ask for the form to be completed after the bid

Bid Due Date/Time: Friday, July 9, 202] @ ]0Oam
Pace2 of 4
Eagle Janitorial Advantage Workforce APDC INTEGRITY STAFFING
Services SOLUTIONS

JOB CLASSIFICATION All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate
Event Day Cleaning Specialist - $12.50 4.00 16.50 6.13 18.63 5.00 17.50 4.37 16.87

Post Clean Porter - $12,50 4.00 16.50 6.13 18.63 5.00 17.50 4.50 17.00

Event Day/Post Clean Supervisor - $15.00 4,00 19.00 7.35 2235 5.00 20.00 5.10 20.1¢
Multiplier for other Job Classifications not listed | No Bid 49% 5.00 437

General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment v v v v
Guarantee of Bid Proposal v v v v
Acknowledgment of Addendums, If Applicable v v v v
Acknowledgment of Bidder v Incomplete v 4
Acknowledgment of Principal v Incomplete v v
Legal Status of Bidder v v v v
Bidder References v v v v
Sworn Statement — Public Entity Crimes v v v v
Swotn Statement — Relationship Disclosure(s) v v v v
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment v v v v
E-Verify Affidavit v v v v
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Bid Checklist (Not a Mandatory Form) v Not Received v v




BID TABUALTION SHEET - TEMPORARY EVENT STAFFING, RIS

Bid Due Date/Time: Frid:y. Julv 9. 2021 i 10am

Page 3 of 4

Amomnts listed below do not necessarily mean the
lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive
and responsible bid package. Tampa Sports Authority
staff must complete a detailed evaluation of each bid
package submitted and, once the evaluation of all bids
submitted is complete, the bid will be awarded to the
bidder who is most responsive 3and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes. Note: All bid forms are
not mandatory and if left out of submittal the Authority
may ask for the form to be completed after the bid

On Target Staffing

Kings Service Solutions

(No Schedules Received
w/Bid Submittal)

HireQuest

LaborMax
Staffing

opening date/time and submitted.

JOB CLASSIFICATION All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Muitiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate | All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate
Event Day Cleaning Specialist - $12.50 1.39 1738 9.32 E 21.82 39.8% 17.48 38% 17.25

Post Clean Porter - $12.50 1.46 1825 9.32 21.82 39.8% 17.48 38% 17.25

Event Day/Post Clean Supervisor - $15.00 1.39 20.85 10.73 25.73 39.8% 2097 38% 20.70
Multiplier for other Job Classifications not listed | 1.39 10.73 39.8% 38%

Bid Checklist (Not 8 Mandatory Form)

General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment v v v v
Guarantee of Bid Proposal v v v v
Acknowledgment of Addendums, If Applicable v Not Acknowledged v v
Acknowledgment of Bidder v v v v
Acknowledgment of Principal v v v N/A
Legal Status of Bidder v v v v
Bidder References v v v v
Sworn Statement — Public Entity Crimes v v v v
Sworn Statement — Relationship Disclosure(s) v v v v
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment v v v v
E-Verify Affidavit v v v v
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
v v v v




BID TABUALTION SHEET — TEMPORARY EVENT STAFFING. RIS

B

Amounts listed below do not necessarily meen the
lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive
and responsible bid package. Tampa Sports Authority
staff nmst complete a detailed evaluation of each bid
package submitted and, once the evaluation of all bids
submitted is complete, the bid will be awarded to the
bidder who is most responsive 3and responsible as
required by Florida Statutes. Note: All bid forms are
not mandatory and if left out of submittal the Authority
may ask for the form to be completed after the bid
opening date/time and submitted.

A & Associates

e Date/Time: Fri Ju 10am
Pugc 4 of 4
FrankCrum Staffing Personnel Solutions City Wide Facility
Solutions

JOB CLASSIFICATION

| All-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate

All-Enclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate

AllInclusive MultipHer | Billing Rate

Al-Inclusive Multiplier | Billing Rate

Event Day Cleaning Specialist - $12.50

5.00

| 1750

NO BID

NOBID

NOBID

Post Clean Porter - $12.50

5.00

| 1750

NOBID

NO BID

NOBID

Event Day/Post Clean Supervisor - $15,00

5.50

NOBID

NOBID

NO BID

Multiplier for other Job Classifications not listed

General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment

5.00

| 20,50

Guerantee of Bid Proposal

Acknowledgment of Addendums, If Applicable

Acknowledgment of Bidder

Acknowledgment of Principal

Legal Status of Bidder

Bidder References

Swomn Statement — Public Entity Crimes

Sworn Statement — Relationship Disclosure(s)

Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment

E-Verify Affidavit
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Statement of No Bid

N/A

Bid Checklist (Not a Mandatory Form)

Not Received

NOBID

NO BID

NO BID




