The amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid package. Tampa
Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed evaluation of each bid package submitted and, once the evaluation of all bids submitted is complete,
the bid will be awarded to the bidder who is most responsive and responsible as required by Florida Statutes. Note: All bid forms are not mandatory
and if left out of submittal the Authority may ask for the form to be completed after the bid opening date/time and submitted.

BID #22-04 (VARIOUS CAMERAS, RJS)

BIDDERS - C & C International Convergint Technologies Viking Security

QUANTITY UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST
Axis M3085-V 02373-001 22 295.00 6,490.00 243.75 5,362.50 239.50 5,269.00
Axis P4705-PLVE 02415-001 8 958.00 7,664.00 782.49 6,259.92 757.37 6,058.96
Axis P3727-PLE 02218-001 62 1,432.00 88,784.00 1,137.50 70,525.00 1117.39 69,278.18
Axis P5654-E 01759-001 14 1,679.00 23,506.00 1,369.69 19,175.66 1329.80 18,617.20
Axis 02414-001 (Addendum Change) 14 2,173.00 30,422.00 1,777.66 24.887.24 1694.91 23,728.74
Axis P3265-LVE 02328-001 4 740.00 2,960.00 603.75 2,415.00 595.17 2,380.68
Axis Q6315-LE 01925-004 4 3,211.00 12,844.00 2,594.69 10,378.76 2566.83 10,267.32
Axis T94NO1D 01513-001 51 98.00 4,998.00 79.66 4,062.66 77.72 3,963.72
Axis T94NO1L 01514-001 8 127.00 1,016.00 104.82 838.56 102.94 823.52
Axis T94A01D 5502-431 18 58.00 1,044.00 47.49 854.82 47.53 855.54
Axis T91DO01D 5504-821 8 98.00 784.00 79.52 636.16 717.72 621.76
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TOTAL - AXIS 180,512.00 145,396.28 141,864.62
Hanwha XNV-6601 22 258.00 5,676.00 210.93 4,640.46 198.36 4,369.92
Hanwha QNV-6082R1 4 346.00 1,384.00 271.25 1,085.00 265.97 1,063.88
Hanwha PNM-7082RVD 8 906.00 7,248.00 732.12 5,856.96 696.00 5,568.00
Hanwha PNM-9084RQZ1 62 1,864.00 115,568.00 1,500.00 93,000.00 1,093.71 67,810.02
Hanwha PNM-9084QZ1 62 1,424.00 88,288.00 1,106.87 68,625.94 1,431.77 88,769.74
Hanwha QNP-6250R 14 1,295.00 18,130.00 1,032.43 14,454.72 994.28 13,919.92
Hanwha QNP-6320R 14 1,922.00 26,908.00 1,057.43 14,804.02 1,342.28 18,791.92
Hanwha XNP-6400 4 2,168.00 8,672.00 1,681.47 6,725.88 1,665.42 6,661.68
Hanwha SBP-276HMW 51 49.00 2,699.00 42.23 2,153.73 37.29 1,901.79
Hanwha SHD-2510FPW 8 49.00 392.00 140.78 1,126.24 124.29 994.32
Hanwha SBP-300WMW 1 8 51.00 408.00 41.98 335.84 39.28 314.24
Hanwha SBP-156HMW 18 42.00 756.00 36.59 658.62 32.31 581.58
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
TOTAL —- HANWHA 275,929.00 213,467.41 210,741.00
ADVECO01 (American Dyn. VideoEdge) 6 220.00 1,320.00 256.61 1,539.66 231.10 1,386.60
GRAND TOTAL (ALL ITEMS) 457,761.00 360,403.35 353,992.23
General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment v v v
Guarantee of Bid Proposal v v v
Acknowledgment of Addenda v v v
Acknow. of Bidder (Corp./Partner/Individual) v v v
Acknowledgment of Principal v v v
Legal Status of Bidder v v v
Bidder References/Qualifications v v v
Public Entity Crimes Statement v v v
Disclosure of Relationships v v v
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment v v v
E-Verify Affidavit v v v
Bid Checklist (Not a mandatory form) v v v
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A N/A




BID #22-04 (VARIOUS CAMERAS, RJS) — Page 2

BIDDERS - GSA Security Minuteman Security B & H Foto & Electronics
QUANTITY UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST UNIT COST EXTENDED COST
Axis M3085-V 02373-001 22 233.74 5,142.28 232.81 5,121.82 269.00 5,918.00
Axis P4705-PLVE 02415-001 8 757.51 6,060.08 752.23 6,017.84 879.00 7,032.00
Axis P3727-PLE 02218-001 62 1,132.74 70,229.88 1,108.00 68,696.00 1,249.00 77,438.00
Axis P5654-E 01759-001 14 1,328.18 18,594.52 1,297.45 18,164.30 1,479.00 20,706.00
Axis 02414-001 (Addendum Change) 14 1,719.05 24,066.70 1,693.31 23,706.34 2,449.00 34,286.00
Axis P3265-LVE 02328-001 4 585.53 2,342.12 578.09 2,312.36 679.00 2,716.00
Axis Q6315-LE 01925-004 4 2,539.89 10,159.56 2,501.86 10,007.44 2,819.00 11,276.00
Axis T94NO1D 01513-001 51 77.39 3,946.89 80.36 4,098.36 99.00 5,049.00
Axis T94NO1L 01514-001 8 100.84 806.79 101.64 813.12 129.00 1,032.00
Axis T94A01D 5502-431 18 46.12 830.16 46.49 836.82 59.00 1,062.00
Axis T91DO01D 5504-821 8 77.39 619.12 80.36 642.88 59.00 792.00
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00 1,404.17 1,404.17 0.00 0.00
TOTAL - AXIS 142,798.10 141,821.45 167,307.00
Hanwha XNV-6601 22 282.13 6,206.86 188.64 4,150.08 209.00 4,598.00
Hanwha QNV-6082R1 4 378.30 1,513.20 259.48 1,037.92 279.00 1,116.00
Hanwha PNM-7082RVD 8 989.93 7,919.44 681.22 5,449.76 699.00 5,592.00
Hanwha PNM-9084RQZ1 62 2,036.44 126,259.28 1,366.88 84,746.56 1,479.00 91,698.00
Hanwha PNM-9084QZ1 62 1,555.61 96,447.82 1,041.19 64,553.78 1,099.00 68,138.00
Hanwha QNP-6250R 14 1,414.18 19,798.52 978.47 13,698.58 999.00 13,986.00
Hanwha QNP-6320R 14 1,909.16 26,728.24 1,266.47 17,730.58 1,349.00 18,886.00
Hanwha XNP-6400 4 2,368.76 9,475.04 1,637.73 6550.92 1,679.00 6,719.00
Hanwha SBP-276HMW 51 53.03 2,704.53 37.44 1909.44 44.00 2,244.00
Hanwha SHD-2510FPW 8 176.78 1,414.24 126.66 1013.28 129.00 1,032.00
Hanwha SBP-300WMW1 8 55.86 446.18 40.48 323.84 47.00 376.00
Hanwha SBP-156HMW 18 45.97 827.46 33.74 607.32 39.00 702.00
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00 0.00 2,017.22 0.00 0.00
TOTAL — HANWHA 299,740.81 203,789.78 215,084.00
ADVECO1 (American Dyn. VideoEdge) 6 220.74 1,324.44 200.00 1,200.00 No Bid No Bid
GRAND TOTAL (ALL ITEMS) 443,863.35 345,611.23 382,391.00
General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment v v
Guarantee of Bid Proposal v v v
Acknowledgment of Addenda v v v
Acknow. of Bidder (Corp./Partner/Individual) v v v
Acknowledgment of Principal v v v
Legal Status of Bidder v v v
Bidder References/Qualifications v v X
Public Entity Crimes Statement v v v
Disclosure of Relationships v v v
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment v v v
E-Verify Affidavit v v v
Bid Checklist (Not a mandatory form) X v v
Statement of No Bid N/A N/A X




BID #22-04 (VARIOUS CAMERAS, RJS) — Page 3

BIDDERS - BEVO Security Markertek — NO BID
QUANTITY UNIT COST EXTENDED COST
Axis M3085-V 02373-001 22 255.30 5,616.60
Axis P4705-PLVE 02415-001 8 821.40 6,571.20
Axis P3727-PLE 02218-001 62 1,226.55 76,046.10
Axis P5654-E 01759-001 14 1,437.45 20,124.30
Axis 02414-001 (Addendum Change) 14 1,859.25 26,029.50
Axis P3265-LVE 02328-001 4 632.70 2,530.80
Axis Q6315-LE 01925-004 4 2,747.25 10,989.00
Axis T94NO1D 01513-001 51 84.36 4,302.36
Axis T94NOIL 01514-001 8 109.89 879.12
Axis T94A01D 5502-431 18 49.95 899.10
Axis T91D01D 5504-821 8 84.36 674.88
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00
TOTAL - AXIS 154,662.96
Hanwha XNV-6601 22 266.40 5860.80
Hanwha QNV-6082R1 4 355.52 1,422.08
Hanwha PNM-7082RVD 8 926.85 7,414.80
Hanwha PNM-9084RQZ1 62 1,903.65 118,026.30
Hanwha PNM-9084QZ1 62 1,454.10 90,154.20
Hanwha QNP-6250R 14 1,323.14 18,523.96
Hanwha QNP-6320R 14 1,803.75 25,252.50
Hanwha XNP-6400 4 2,214.45 8,857.80
Hanwha SBP-276HMW 51 53.28 2,717.28
Hanwha SHD-2510FPW 8 172.05 1,376.40
Hanwha SBP-300WMW 1 8 57.72 461.76
Hanwha SBP-156HMW 18 46.62 839.16
FREIGHT 1 0.00 0.00
TOTAL - HANWHA 280,907.04
ADVECO1 (American Dyn. VideoEdge) 6 1,378.95 8,273.70
GRAND TOTAL (ALL ITEMS) 443,843.70
General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment v
Guarantee of Bid Proposal v
Acknowledgment of Addenda v
Acknow. of Bidder (Corp./Partner/Individual) v
Acknowledgment of Principal v
Legal Status of Bidder v
Bidder References/Qualifications v
Public Entity Crimes Statement Incomplete (2" Page Missing)
Disclosure of Relationships Incomplete (2" Page Missing)
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment v
E-Verify Affidavit v
Bid Checklist (Not a mandatory form) v
Statement of No Bid N/A




