

BID #18-18: TSA STAFFING SERVICES, RJS – Bid Due Date: Friday, June 7, 2019 @ 10am - Pricing Listed is the Extended Rate per Position

Amounts listed below do not necessarily mean the lowest listed cost bid constitutes the lowest responsive and responsible bid package. Tampa Sports Authority staff must complete a detailed evaluation of each bid package submitted and, once the evaluation of all bids submitted is complete, the bid will be awarded to the bidder who is most responsive and responsible as required by Florida Statutes.	Inspired Staffing Solutions, LLC	Accurate Personnel Services	Hire Quest, LLC dba: Trojan Labor	People Ready Florida	Rapid Staffing	APDC Cleaning Services	Adecco	Dynamic Staffing Solutions
Cleaning Specialist 1	321,438	360,999.60 *	346,164	348,826.80	337,509.90	304,320	NO BID	NO BID
Cleaning Specialist 2	105,948	114,580.80	113,796	110,787.60	107,125.20	98,100		
Cleaning Specialist 3	164,780	171,842	170,665	166,171	160,660.50	149,800		
Cleaning Specialist 4	47,800	49,932	49,590	48,256.20	46,683	44,460		
Cleaning Porter	137,274.06 *	143,161.38 *	142,176.71	138,476.40	137,274.06	129,147.90		
General Maintenance – Unskilled	145,600	151,840	150,800	146,744 *	147,680	135,200		
General Maintenance – Skilled	64,064	66,809.60	66,352	64,604.80	64,979.20	58,240		
<i>Multiplier for other job(s) not listed</i>	NO COMMENT	NO COMMENT	1.45	NO COMMENT	.42	NO COMMENT		
GRAND CONTRACT TOTAL (3 YEARS)	996,994.06 *	1,059,165.38 *	1,039,543.71	1,023,966.80 *	1,001,911.86	919,287.90	NO BID	NO BID
General Terms & Conditions Acknowledgment	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Guarantee of Bid Proposal	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Acknowledgment of Addenda	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Acknowledgment of Bidder (Corporation, Partnership, Individual)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Acknowledgment of Principal, if Corporation	✓	✓	✓	N/A	✓	✓		
Legal Status of Bidder	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Bidder Reference/Qualification Form	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Sworn Statement – Public Entity Crimes	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Sworn Statement – Relationship Disclosure(s)	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Drug-Free Workplace Acknowledgment	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		
Statement of No Bid	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A		
Bid Checklist	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓	✓		

BID TABULATION NOTES FOR BID 18-18 (TSA STAFFING SERVICES)

*** - Indicates an error in multiplication or addition**

People Ready showed the actual cost/hour with multiplier included.

APDC showed the actual cost/hour with multiplier included.